

EXHIBIT F



HAGENS BERMAN

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

HAGENS BERMAN SOBOL SHAPIRO LLP
1918 EIGHTH AVENUE, SUITE 3300
SEATTLE, WA 98101
www.hbsslaw.com

December 18, 2014
Hyundai/Kia MPG
Client/Matter # 10339-0012
Invoice No: 267749438

RE: Brady v. Hyundai and Kia

Billing Summary Through December 10, 2014

Fees For Professional Services	\$59,327.00
Expenses and Advances	\$1,632.53
CURRENT BILL	\$60,959.53
TOTAL BALANCE DUE	\$60,959.53

Client No.: 10339

Page 2

Invoice No.: 267749438

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			HOURS	AMOUNT
10/31/2012	RBC	Emails with Camille Bass regarding case status.	0.30	\$210.00
11/1/2012	ASJ	Correspondence with Camille Bass re potential class representatives.	0.60	\$204.00
11/1/2012	LWA	Correspondence with Camille Bass re potential class representatives.	0.60	\$330.00
11/1/2012	RBC	Correspondence with Camille Bass regarding complaint.	1.20	\$840.00
11/5/2012	CJ	Send final Complaint to Rob Carey (.1); emails regarding database (.2); prepare Notice of Related Case and Civil Cover Sheet and attachment (1); conferences regarding same (1); create database shell (1.8); proof Complaint and further revisions (1.4).	5.50	\$825.00
11/5/2012	CSB	Correspondence with Rob Carey, Cindy Johnson, and Marci Perkins regarding intakes (.5); correspondence with Rob regarding Rights & Responsibilities letters (.9); emails to potential class representatives and members (1.1); revise Rights and Responsibilities letters (2); emails and calls to potential class reps (2.4); worked on new complaint (3.1)	10.30	\$3,038.50
11/5/2012	MLP	Assist with preparing documents to accompany Complaint (3.2); prepare database (1.3); monitor incoming calls and e-mails (.7).	5.20	\$780.00
11/5/2012	RBC	Communications with Elaine Byszewski re complaint filing.	0.40	\$280.00
11/6/2012	CJ	Final revisions to Complaint and supporting documents.	2.00	\$300.00
11/6/2012	CSB	Work on complaint (5.1) phone calls with potential class representatives (2.2); emails with potential class reps (1.8).	9.10	\$2,684.50
11/6/2012	MLP	Assist with finalizing documents to be filed with Complaint (4.1); correspondence with potential class members (1.3); update database (.8).	6.20	\$930.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 3

Invoice No.: 267749438

11/7/2012	CSB	Respond to emails from potential class members (4.1); mails and discussions with Rob Carey and Marci Perkins regarding same (2.1); address class representative issues (.9).	7.10	\$2,094.50
11/7/2012	MLP	E-mails and phone calls with potential class members (2.7); update database (2.6).	5.30	\$795.00
11/8/2012	CJ	Research Central District of California for similar cases; set Courtlink alert for related cases.	0.70	\$105.00
11/8/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (5.1); emails with Rob Carey and Marci Perkins regarding same (2.3); update list of states for which we still need class representatives (.3).	7.40	\$2,183.00
11/8/2012	MLP	Return phone calls and e-mails from potential class members.	6.90	\$1,035.00
11/9/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (3.1); emails with Rob Carey and Marci Perkins regarding same (1.7); update list of states for which we still need class representatives (.2); emails with Rob Carey, Cindy Johnson, and Marci Perkins regarding notices of related cases (1.2); emails with Jennifer Conte, Rob, and Marci regarding class representative (.4); discussion with Marci regarding status of calls/email/database (1.1).	7.70	\$2,271.50
11/9/2012	MLP	Return phone calls and send follow-up e-mails to potential class members (4.8); update and maintain database (1.6).	6.40	\$960.00
11/11/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members and emails with Rob Carey and Marci Perkins regarding same (.4); emails with Rob regarding complaint (.2).	0.60	\$177.00
11/12/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (1.6); emails with Marci Perkins regarding same (.4).	2.00	\$590.00
11/13/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members and potential class representatives (2.3); emails with Rob Carey and Marci Perkins regarding same (.5); update list of states for which we still need class representatives (.2); emails and discussions with Rob, Cindy	7.80	\$2,301.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 4

Invoice No.: 267749438

Johnson, Marci Perkins, and Michelle Leech regarding status of calls/email/database (.8). Drafted FAQ sheet for website and potential class members (2.9); revised Rights and Responsibilities letter.

11/13/2012	MLP	Respond to voicemails and e-mails of potential class members (6.1); update database accordingly (1).	7.10	\$1,065.00
11/14/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (4.9); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same (1.3); emails with Rob Carey, Cindy Johnson, and Marci regarding website and FAQs (.6); emails with Audrey Froehlich, Cindy, Marci, and Michelle Leech regarding perspective roles (.5)	7.30	\$2,153.50
11/14/2012	MLP	Emails and phone calls with prospective class members (5.6); update database (1.3).	6.90	\$1,035.00
11/15/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (4); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same and regarding database (2.3).	6.30	\$1,858.50
11/15/2012	MLP	Review e-mails and voicemail messages (.8); update database from 11/05/12 through 11/14/12 (6.6).	7.40	\$1,110.00
11/16/2012	CSB	Emails and phone calls re web sign-ups (1.4); discussion with Rob Carey regarding window stickers (.8); update list of Class Representatives and corresponding states (.4); discussion and emails with Marci Perkins regarding database and sign-ups (1.2).	3.80	\$1,121.00
11/16/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails and e-mails from prospective class members (4.2); update database (2.4).	6.60	\$990.00
11/19/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (5.3); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same (1.1); update chart of states and corresponding Class Reps (.5); annotate complaint filed 11.06.12 and add potential class reps from currently unrepresented states (1.2).	8.10	\$2,389.50
11/20/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members and representatives (2.4); update chart of states and corresponding Class Reps (.6); work on	5.90	\$1,740.50

Client No.: 10339

Page 5

Invoice No.: 267749438

Rights and Responsibilities letters and tracking (.9); emails with Marci Perkins and Cindy Johnson regarding same (.4); emails with Marci regarding call-ins (.6); bookmark Schedule of Actions (1.2).

11/20/2012	MLP	Update database of class members and corresponding documents.	5.70	\$855.00
11/21/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members.	2.80	\$826.00
11/21/2012	MLP	Update database of class members and corresponding documents.	4.30	\$645.00
11/22/2012	CSB	Emails with Rob Carey regarding plaintiffs' locations.	0.20	\$59.00
11/26/2012	CSB	Emails and discussions with Rob Carey regarding plaintiffs (1.1); discussion with Marci Perkins regarding status of case (1.1); emails with potential class members (2.3); draft templates for filing Notice (1.3).	5.80	\$1,711.00
11/26/2012	MLP	Revise and update database (2.9); review incoming emails and voicemails from potential class members (1.8); prepare and file Notice of Appearance in MDL Case No. 2424 (1.2).	5.90	\$885.00
11/27/2012	CSB	Emails with Marci Perkins regarding sign-ups (.6); emails with Larry Kunzler regarding same (.4); phone call with potential class member (.4); emails with potential class members (.3); discussion with Rob Carey regarding same (.8).	2.40	\$708.00
11/27/2012	MLP	Update database (.8); respond to voicemails and emails from potential class members (1.8).	2.60	\$390.00
11/28/2012	CSB	Emails and calls with potential class members (2.4); discussions and emails with Marci Perkins regarding same (.9).	3.30	\$973.50
11/28/2012	MLP	Update database (1.8); respond to voicemails and emails from potential class members (2.8); update case calendar (.6).	5.20	\$780.00
11/29/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (.8); discussion with Rob Carey regarding same (.4); emails with Marci Perkins regarding	2.60	\$767.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 6

Invoice No.: 267749438

		same (.2); emails and discussions with Marci, Rob, Georgia O'Neill, and Cindy Johnson regarding dismissal of class member (1.2).		
11/29/2012	MLP	Review and respond to voicemails and emails from potential class members (3.5); update database (1.2).	4.70	\$705.00
11/30/2012	CSB	Reviewed emails between Marci Perkins and potential plaintiffs.	0.20	\$59.00
11/30/2012	MLP	Review and respond to voicemails and emails from potential class members (2.8); update database (1.1).	3.90	\$585.00
12/2/2012	CSB	Emails regarding mail from potential class members. Emails from potential class members.	0.20	\$59.00
12/3/2012	CSB	Emails with Larry Kunzler and Rob Carey regarding letter from senator about Hyundai's and Kia's reimbursement program (.4); emails with potential class members (1.6); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same (.2); call with potential class member (.3); draft email update (.5); emails with Rob and Marci regarding same (.4); update annotated complaint (.7).	3.90	\$1,150.50
12/3/2012	MLP	Respond to voicemails and emails from potential class members (3.5); update database (1.2).	4.70	\$705.00
12/4/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class representative and potential class members (1.2); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same (.3); review reimbursement terms (.6); emails with Rob Carey and Marci regarding same (.2).	2.30	\$678.50
12/4/2012	MLP	Respond to phone calls, voicemails, and e-mails of potential class members (1.6); update database (.8).	2.40	\$360.00
12/5/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (.8); emails and discussions with Marci Perkins regarding same (.2); discussions and emails with Rob Carey and Cindy Johnson regarding response to motion to consolidate/transfer (.4).	1.40	\$413.00
12/6/2012	CSB	Emails with potential class members (1.1); review motion to transfer (.2); discussions with Cindy Johnson regarding same (.2).	1.50	\$442.50

Client No.: 10339

Page 7

Invoice No.: 267749438

12/6/2012	MLP	Response to voicemails, e-mails and telephone calls from potential class members (1.3); update database (.6).	1.90	\$285.00
12/7/2012	ETB	Correspondence with Rob Carey regarding discovery pertaining to Hyundai document.	0.70	\$385.00
12/7/2012	MLP	Response to emails from potential class members (1); update database (.2).	1.20	\$180.00
12/10/2012	MLP	Response to voicemails, emails, and telephone calls from potential class members (.7); update database (.2).	0.90	\$135.00
12/11/2012	MLP	Respond to voicemails, emails, and telephone calls from potential class members (1.1); update database (.3); review incoming Orders from the Court and update case calendars accordingly (.7).	2.10	\$315.00
12/12/2012	MLP	Respond to voicemails, emails and telephone calls from potential class members (.5); update database (.1)	0.60	\$90.00
12/13/2012	CJ	Send Complaints to Michael Dvorin in Israel; review calendar for Rule 26(f) Scheduling deadline.	0.30	\$45.00
12/13/2012	MLP	Response to emails, voicemails and telephone calls from potential class members (1.5); update database (.3).	1.80	\$270.00
12/14/2012	CJ	Email return of service forms to Elaine Byszewski for filing and inquire about Pro Hac Vices.	0.20	\$30.00
12/14/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails, emails, and telephone calls from potential class members (2.3); update database and manage class member documents (.5); send update emails to all potential class members in database (.4).	3.20	\$480.00
12/17/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails, e-mails, and telephone calls from potential class members (2.8); update database (.9).	3.70	\$555.00
12/18/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails, e-mails, and telephone calls from	3.70	\$555.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 8

Invoice No.: 267749438

potential class members (3.2); update database (.5).

12/19/2012	CJ	Receive email from Camille Bass regarding service on Kia; prepare Notice of Lawsuit and Request for Waiver of Service of Summons and send to Rob Carey.	0.20	\$30.00
12/19/2012	JCO	Prepped Waivers of Service for filing and filed.	0.50	\$75.00
12/19/2012	MLP	Respond to e-mails from potential class members (1.2); update database (.5); update case calendars (.4).	2.10	\$315.00
12/20/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails and e-mails from potential class members (.7); update database (.1).	0.70	\$105.00
12/21/2012	MLP	Respond to e-mails, voice mails, and telephone calls from potential class members (.7); update database (.1).	0.80	\$120.00
12/24/2012	MLP	Respond to e-mails from potential class members; update database.	0.30	\$45.00
12/26/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails, e-mails, and telephone calls from potential class members and update database.	0.70	\$105.00
12/27/2012	MLP	Respond to voice mails, e-mails, and telephone calls from potential class members (.4); update database (.1); draft Notice of Change of Attorney Information and forward to attorney for review and approval (.6).	1.10	\$165.00
12/28/2012	MLP	Respond to e-mails from potential class members (.5); update database (.1)	0.60	\$90.00
1/2/2013	MLP	Respond to e-mails, voicemails, and telephone calls from potential class members (2.4); update database (.3).	2.70	\$405.00
1/3/2013	MLP	Respond to e-mails, voice mails and phone calls from potential class members (1.1); update database (.2).	1.30	\$195.00
1/4/2013	MLP	Respond to e-mails, voice mails, and telephone calls from	3.20	\$480.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 9

Invoice No.: 267749438

potential class members (.9); update database(.2); finalize Notice of Change in Attorney form and begin pro hac vice procedures (2.1).

1/7/2013	RBC	Telephone conference with Steve Berman re mediation.	0.50	\$350.00
1/9/2013	MLP	Finalize, file and serve Notice of Change of Attorney (.7); update case calendar (.2).	0.90	\$135.00
1/14/2013	RBC	Discuss filing issues with Camille Bass.	0.10	\$70.00
1/16/2013	RBC	Emails with Camille Bass regarding proposed order to extend class-certification deadline.	0.10	\$70.00
1/17/2013	MLP	Process paperwork for obtaining Robert Carey's Certificate of Good Standing for pro hac vice admission.	0.20	\$30.00
1/30/2013	RBC	Emails with Camille Bass regarding disclosure deadlines.	0.40	\$280.00
2/1/2013	MLP	Complete Pro Hac Vice forms for Rob Carey.	0.40	\$60.00
2/1/2013	RBC	Emails with Camille Bass regarding stipulation to extend discovery deadlines.	0.10	\$70.00
2/5/2013	MLP	Finalize, file, and serve Pro Hac Vice applications and proposed orders for Rob Carey and Steve Berman.	0.90	\$135.00
2/12/2013	CJ	Receipt and review of Pro Hac Vice orders for Rob Carey and Steve Berman.	0.20	\$30.00
2/13/2013	RBC	Conference with Leonard Aragon re settlement.	0.50	\$350.00
2/22/2013	CJ	Meet with Cindy Johnson re rules and procedures regarding possible sealing of notice of settlement disclosure.	0.10	\$15.00
3/4/2013	RBC	Telephone conference with Steve Berman re to-do.	0.50	\$350.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 10

Invoice No.: 267749438

3/4/2013	RBC	Discuss and review current case issue with Cindy Johnson.	0.20	\$140.00
3/22/2013	CJ	Prepare declaration of Rob Carey regarding request for Rule 408 documents.	0.50	\$75.00
3/26/2013	CJ	Assist Carrie Flexer with Joint Status Report; serve counsel and send chamber copies.	0.70	\$105.00
3/26/2013	CLF	Proof joint status report (.6); make Eric Gibbs' edits per Steve Berman (.8); format caption and Efile same (1.1)	2.50	\$475.00
3/27/2013	CJ	Prepare spreadsheet for Kia settlement.	2.60	\$390.00
5/29/2013	AEG	Prepare documents and notebook for review.	1.00	\$150.00
12/17/2013	JMD	Strategize with Rob Carey and Michael Kidney re revisions to draft settlement agreement.	0.40	\$158.00
12/27/2013	RBC	Strategize with John DeStefano re revisions to draft.	0.40	\$280.00

Total Fees

\$59,327.00

SERVICES RECAP

		HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JMD	DeStefano, John M	0.40	395.00	\$158.00
LWA	Aragon, Leonard W	0.60	550.00	\$330.00
CSB	Bass, Camille S	110.00	295.00	\$32,450.00
ETB	Byszewski, Elaine T	0.70	550.00	\$385.00
RBC	Carey, Rob B	4.70	700.00	\$3,290.00
JCO	Conte, Jennifer A	0.50	150.00	\$75.00
CLF	Flexer, Carrie L	2.50	190.00	\$475.00
AEG	Garcia, Adrian E	1.00	150.00	\$150.00
CJ	Johnson, Cindy J	13.00	150.00	\$1,950.00
MLP	Perkins, Marci L	132.40	150.00	\$19,860.00
ASJ	St. John, Andy	0.60	340.00	\$204.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 11

Invoice No.: 267749438

EXPENSES

11/27/2012	Internal Copies	\$69.00
12/07/2012	ACE Attorney Service, Inc.; Invoice # 107957; Messenger/process service. Priority PDF filing done on 11/06/12.	\$616.38
01/08/2013	Supreme Court of Arizona; Invoice # Hunter 01/07/2013; Misc. costs. Certificate of Good Standing for Robert Carey.	\$17.00
01/18/2013	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q42012; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charge for period of 10/01/2012 - 12/31/2012	\$4.90
03/05/2013	Chase Card Services; Invoice # 0037 0108 02/19/13; Misc. costs. Certificate of Good Standing for Steve Berman.	\$16.25
03/28/2013	American Express; Invoice # Feb-13 AMEX (CJ); Pro Hac Vice Filing Fee for Rob Carey, 02/05/13	\$325.00
03/28/2013	American Express; Invoice # Feb-13 AMEX (CJ); Pro Hac Vice Filing Fee for Steve Berman, 02/05/13	\$325.00
04/18/2013	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q12013; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charges for period of 01/01/2013 - 03/31/2013.	\$11.00
04/18/2013	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q12013; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charges for period of 01/01/2013 - 03/31/2013.	\$242.00
07/23/2013	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q22013; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charges for period of 04/01/13 - 06/30/13.	\$3.00
07/24/2014	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q22014; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charges for period of 04/01/2014 - 06/30/2014.	\$0.50
12/10/2014	Copies	\$2.50
Total Expenses		\$1,632.53
